T-628(5) AGRICULTURAL TYPE TRACTORS AND ATTACHMENTS
TRACTORS, AG TYPE and ATTACHMENTS DISCOUNT OFF LIST

#422-1118 SPECIFICATION 3.0

Vendor Name: Trueman Welters Inc

November, 2019

Contact Person:  Seth Strehler

Street Address: 1600 Highway 55 east

P.O. Box:

City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn<55313
Phone #: 763-682-2200

Toll Free #: n/a

Email Address: seth@welters.net

Spec. Number Information Requested Answer
3.1 MANUFACTURER New Holland
3.2 DATE AND ID. OF PRICE LIST Oct 4 2019 No 19-52a
3.3 CATALOG SECTION TITLE T3F Series
3.4 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST 18%
3.5 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS & ACCESSORIES
(See Special Terms and Conditions) 0.0%
3.6 PRICE FOR MANUALS (1 operator's manual included at no cost, per specs)
SERVICE MANUAL
Digital $ 150.00
Paper $ 450.00
PARTS MANUAL
Digital free online
Paper n/a
PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS MANUAL
Digital $ 100.00
Paper $ 150.00
3.7 PRICE FOR SET OF FLUID AND AIR FILTERS $600
3.8 STANDARD WARRANTY: 12 month / 2000 hours
3.9 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS

Offer performance/warranty options. (Add additional lines if necessary.)
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)

n/a
$
3.10 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR (Hourly Shop Rate) $119.00
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions
3.11 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list
the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate. Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser
that will be applied to the purchase price. See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.
Hourly Rental Rate: no bid

Weekly Rental Rate: no bid
Monthly Rental Rate: no bid
Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price: no bid

If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:

3.12 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
(See Special Terms and Conditions.)
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price No Bid
3.13 DELIVERY STARTING POINT - City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn <55313

See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed 3.50 per mile

Minimum Delivery Charge $250.00
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-TIMR 01

T3F STANDARD ROPS FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

T3. 60F

54 Gross Engine hp

40 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engine

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

T3. 70F

64 Gross Engine hp

50 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

T3. 80F

74 Gross Engine hp

60 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + DOO)
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh-pressure Conmon Rail System
El ectric Engi ne Shut of f
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Ad
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Vertical Exhaust
12. 0 gal Fuel Tank
320/ 70R20 rear & 200/70R16 front tires

TRANSM SSI ON:
LH si de col utmm nount ed
nmechani cal shuttle
RH col um nounted range | ever
RH onsol e mount ed gear | ever
12 x 12
(4) Synchronized Gears
(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges
(1) 11" dry clutch
25 mph (40 KPH) - varies by tire size
Hand Operated Park Brake
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STEERI NG BRAKES:

Hydrostatic Power Steering

Brakes- Hydraulically assisted, self
adj usting wet disc

4AVD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro- Hydraul i c engagenment standard

Adj ustable Tread Wdth from44.2 in.
to 49.4 in.

REAR AXLE

Fl ange Type

Adj ustabl e Tread Wdth 40.9 in.
to 55.5 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I npl ement Punp: 12.5 gpm (47.7 L)
Steering Punmp: 7.9 gpm (30.0 L)
Total Flow 20.4 gpm (76.4 L)

(2) Open Center Double Acting
Renot e Val ves

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
El ect rohydraulic

PTO

Ful Iy I ndependent
Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard
540/ 540E

Mechani cal engagenent
Dry clutch (11 in.)
1-3/8 in. 6 splines

3-PO NT LI FT SYSTEM

Ri ght hand consol e nount ed
| ever control

Mechani cal Draft Control

4,000 Pounds Lift Capacity

Category I/11 Ends

Chain Stabilizers

Z Shaped arms

Fi xed Link Ends

-TIMR 01 0035 000 01-JAN-20




Y% NEW HOLLAND TIMR 01

AGRICULTURE

T3F STANDARD ROPS FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

ROPS CPERATCR PROTECTI VE

ELECTRI CAL: STRUCTURE:
(1) 860 cca Heavy-Duty Battery Center mounted fol dabl e ROPS
120 amp Alternator Steering wheel - telescopic
7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplenent |ighting Steering console - |left hand shuttle
and signals | ever, right hand range |ever,
40 anp socket lights, switch banks for diplay
12V power socket (cigarette lighter) controls, differential |ock hazard
lights and 4WD, and center nounted
I NSTRUVENTATI ON: PTO engagenent | ever.
Anal og I nstrunmentation with warning Ri ght hand console - throttle,
lights for turn signals, high beam Lift-O watic, gear |lever, renote
work lights, side lights, rear PTQ levers & rear hitch control
AW, differential |ock, |ow fuel, Left hand side - hand brake |ever
alternator, oil pressure, brake fluid, Seat - vynl covered nechani cal
grid heater & hand brake suspensi on, operator's presence
Gauges for fuel level, engine sensor
tenperature and tachoneter Suspended pedal s
Di gital Readout for PTO speed,
ground speed, battery & hours M SCELLANEQUS:
Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
LI GHTI NG SW Enbl em
Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights 6 Front Wights
Rear: (1) worklight
Turn Signal s/ Fl ashers/ Rear Lights WARRANTY:

New Hol I and Standard Warranty Applies
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Y% NEW HOLLAND TIMR 01

T3F STANDARD ROPS FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

Models
COMMERCIAL MODEL Weight Factory Data List Price
T3.60F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9031494P84 $40,378.00
T3.70F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9032742P84 $41,978.00
T3.80F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9033989P28 $43,576.00
Factory Supplied Options
Order Code Description | Weight | Factory Data List Price
| TIRES |
| FRONT |
SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
8806401 | 200/70R16 A8 No Charge
Requires 320/70R20 rear tires (8912401)
8040491 | FRONT 260/70R16 9000166P14 $213.00
Requires 360/70R24 rear tires (8935491)
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-TIMR 01

T3F STANDARD ROPS FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST

REAR

SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

8912401 | 320/70R20 A8 No Charge
Requires 200/70R16 front tires (8816401)
8935491 | FRONT 360/70R24 9000665P34 $853.00
Requires 260/70R16 front tires (8040491)
| HYDRAULICS |
| REAR REMOTES |
SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES
335640 |3 REMOTE VALVE 9000623P22 $799.00
1 Double acting remote valve +
1 Double acting with float and kick out +
1 Double acting with float, kick out & flow control
| WEIGHTS |
[ REAR |
SD_T4961 REAR BALLAST
744760 | 200KG #4 RINGS 50KG 9000474P24 $608.00
2 Rear wheel weights per side
For 20" tires = Two 99 Ib weights per side = 396 Ibs total
For 24" tires = Two 110 |b weights per side = 440 Ibs total
| OPERATOR'S MANUALS |
SD_T9802 OPERATORS MANUAL
| | | 333986 | Spanish Operator's Manual, No Charge|
SD_T9803 FRENCH OPERATOR MANUAL
| | | XT9803X | Less French Operator Manual No Chargel
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-TIMR 02

T3F DELUXE ROPS FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

T3. 60F

54 Gross Engine hp

40 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engine

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

T3. 70F

64 Gross Engine hp

50 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

T3. 80F

74 Gross Engine hp

60 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + DOO)
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh-pressure Conmon Rail System
El ectri c Engi ne Shut of f
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Ad
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Vertical Exhaust
12.0 gal Fuel Tank
320/ 70R20 rear & 200/70R16 front tires

TRANSM SSI ON:

LH si de col utmm nount ed
nmechani cal shuttle

RH col um nounted range | ever

RH onsol e mount ed gear |ever
20 x 20 Creeper
(4) Synchronized Gears
(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges

Creeper in Range 1 & 2

(1) 11" dry clutch

25 mph (40 KPH) - varies by tire size

Hand Operated Park Brake
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STEERI NG BRAKES:

Hydrostatic Power Steering

Brakes- Hydraulically assisted, self
adj usting wet disc

AWD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro- Hydraul i ¢ engagenent standard

Adj ustable Tread Wdth from44.2 in.
to 49.4 in.

REAR AXLE

Fl ange Type

Adj ustable Tread Wdth 40.9 in.
to 55.5 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I mpl ement Punp: 12.5 gpm (47.7 L)
Steering Punmp: 7.9 gpm (30.0 L)
Total Flow. 20.4 gpm (76.4 L)

(2) Open Center Double Acting
Renot e Val ves

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
El ect rohydraulic

PTO

Ful Il y I ndependent

Fli p-up PTO Shaft Guard
540/ 540E

Mechani cal engagenent
Dry clutch (11 in.)
1-3/8 in. 6 splines

3-PO NT LIFT SYSTEM

Ri ght hand consol e nounted
| ever control

Mechani cal Draft Control

4,000 Pounds Lift Capacity

Category I/11 Ends

Chain Stabilizers

Z Shaped arms
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-TIMR 02

T3F DELUXE ROPS FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

Fi xed Li nk Ends

ELECTRI CAL:

(1) 860 cca Heavy-Duty Battery

120 anp Alternator

7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplement |ighting
and signals

40 anp socket

12V power socket (cigarette lighter)

| NSTRUMENTATI ON:

Anal og I nstrunmentation with warning
lights for turn signals, high beam
work lights, side lights, rear PTQ
4WD, differential |ock, |ow fuel,
alternator, oil pressure, brake fluid,
grid heater & hand brake

Gauges for fuel |evel, engine
tenmperature and tachoneter

Di gi tal Readout for PTO speed,
ground speed, battery & hours

LI GHTI NG

Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights
Rear: (1) worklight

Turn Signal s/ Fl ashers/ Rear Lights
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ROPS CPERATCR PROTECTI VE

STRUCTURE:

Center nounted fol dabl e ROPS
Steering wheel - telescopic

Steering console - left hand shuttle

| ever, right hand range |ever,
lights, switch banks for diplay
controls, differential |ock hazard
lights and 4WD, and center nounted
PTO engagenent | ever.

Ri ght hand console - throttle,
Lift-O watic, gear |lever, renote
levers & rear hitch control

Left hand side - hand brake | ever

Seat - vynl covered nechani cal
suspensi on, operator's presence
sensor

Suspended pedal s

M SCELLANECUS:

Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
SW Enbl em

6 Front Wights

WARRANTY:
New Hol I and Standard Warranty Applies
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S? NEW HOLLAND -TIMR 02

T3F DELUXE ROPS FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

Models
COMMERCIAL MODEL Weight Factory Data List Price
T3.60F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9031494P84 $40,378.00
T3.70F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9032742P84 $41,978.00
T3.80F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9033989P28 $43,576.00
Factory Supplied Options
Order Code Description | Weight | Factory Data List Price
| TIRES |
[ FRONT |
SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
8806401 | 200/70R16 A8 No Charge
Requires 320/70R20 rear tires (8912401)
8040491 | FRONT 260/70R16 9000166P14 $213.00
Requires 360/70R24 rear tires (8935491)
REAR |
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
8912401 | 320/70R20 A8 No Charge
Requires 200/70R16 front tires (8816401)
8935491 | FRONT 360/70R24 9000665P34 $853.00
Requires 260/70R16 front tires (8040491)
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S? NEW HOLLAND -TIMR 02

AGRICULTURE

T3F DELUXE ROPS FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

| OPERATOR'S MANUALS

SD_T9802 OPERATORS MANUAL

| | | 333986 | Spanish Operator's Manual, | | | No Charge |
SD_T9803 FRENCH OPERATOR MANUAL

| | | XT9803X | Less French Operator Manual | | | No Charge |
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-TIMR 03

T3F A LA CARTE
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

T3. 60F

54 Gross Engine hp

40 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engine

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

T3. 70F

64 Gross Engine hp

50 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

T3. 80F

74 Gross Engine hp

60 PTO hp @2300 rpm

3 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne

179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacenment

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + DOO)
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh-pressure Conmon Rail System
El ectric Engi ne Shut of f
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Ad
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Vertical Exhaust
12. 0 gal Fuel Tank
320/ 70R20 rear & 200/70R16 front tires

TRANSM SSI ON:
LH si de col utmm nount ed
nmechani cal shuttle
RH col um nounted range | ever
RH onsol e mount ed gear | ever
12 x 12
(4) Synchronized Gears
(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges
(1) 11" dry clutch
25 mph (40 KPH) - varies by tire size
Hand Operated Park Brake
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STEERI NG BRAKES:

Hydrostatic Power Steering

Brakes- Hydraulically assisted, self
adj usting wet disc

4AVD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro- Hydraul i c engagenment standard

Adj ustable Tread Wdth from44.2 in.
to 49.4 in.

REAR AXLE

Fl ange Type

Adj ustabl e Tread Wdth 40.9 in.
to 55.5 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I npl ement Punp: 12.5 gpm (47.7 L)
Steering Punmp: 7.9 gpm (30.0 L)
Total Flow 20.4 gpm (76.4 L)

(2) Open Center Double Acting
Renot e Val ves

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
El ect rohydraulic

PTO

Ful Iy I ndependent
Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard
540/ 540E

Mechani cal engagenent
Dry clutch (11 in.)
1-3/8 in. 6 splines

3-PO NT LI FT SYSTEM

Ri ght hand consol e nount ed
| ever control

Mechani cal Draft Control

4,000 Pounds Lift Capacity

Category I/11 Ends

Chain Stabilizers

Z Shaped arms

Fi xed Link Ends
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-TIMR 03

T3F A LA CARTE
US PRICE LIST

ELECTRI CAL:

Standard Equipment

(1) 860 cca Heavy-Duty Battery

120 anp Al ternator

7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplenent |ighting

and signal s
40 anp socket

12V power socket (cigarette lighter)

I NSTRUMVENTATI ON:

Anal og I nstrunmentation with warning

lights for turn signals,
work lights, side lights,
AWD, differential |ock, |
alternator, oil pressure,
grid heater & hand brake
Gauges for fuel |evel, engi

hi gh beam
rear PTO

ow fuel,
brake fl uid,

ne

tenperature and tachoneter
Di gital Readout for PTO speed,
ground speed, battery & hours

LI GHTI NG

Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights

Rear: (1) worklight
Turn Signal s/ Fl asher s/ Rear

Li ghts
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ROPS CPERATCR PROTECTI VE

STRUCTURE:

Center nounted fol dabl e ROPS
Steering wheel - telescopic

Steering console - |left hand shuttle

| ever, right hand range |ever,
lights, switch banks for diplay
controls, differential |ock hazard
lights and 4WD, and center nounted
PTO engagenent | ever.

Ri ght hand console - throttle,
Lift-O watic, gear |lever, renote
levers & rear hitch control

Left hand side - hand brake | ever

Seat - vynl covered nechani cal
suspensi on, operator's presence
sensor

Suspended pedal s

M SCELLANECUS:
Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
SW Enbl em

WARRANTY:
New Hol I and Standard Warranty Applies
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-TIMR 03

T3F A LA CARTE
US PRICE LIST

Models
COMMERCIAL MODEL Weight Factory Data List Price
T3.60F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9031494P84 $40,378.00
T3.70F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9032742P84 $41,978.00
T3.80F TIER4A 8,158 LB 9033989P28 $43,576.00

Factory Supplied Options

| Order Code

| Weight | Factory Data

Description List Price |
| POWER TRAIN |
| TRANSMISSION |

SD_T2810 TRANSMISSION
744678 | 20+20 SYN&CREEPER 9000623P22 $799.00
12x12 shuttle + 2 creeper ranges
5 ranges with 4 gears per range
| TIRES |
| FrRONT |
SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
8299801 | Non-Return Ship Wheels - 4WD 9000042P12 $54.00
8806401 | 200/70R16 A8 No Charge
Requires 320/70R20 rear tires (8912401)
8040491 | FRONT 260/70R16 9000166P14 $213.00
Requires 360/70R24 rear tires (8935491)
REAR |
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
8399801 | Non-Returnable Shipping Wheel 9000290P94 $373.00
8912401 | 320/70R20 A8 No Charge
Requires 200/70R16 front tires (8816401)
8935491 | FRONT 360/70R24 9000665P34 $853.00
Requires 260/70R16 front tires (8040491)
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V% NEW HOLLAND

-TIMR 03

T3F A LA CARTE
US PRICE LIST

| HYDRAULICS

|  REAR REMOTES

SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES

335640 | 3 REMOTE VALVE 9000623P22 $799.00
1 Double acting remote valve +
1 Double acting with float and kick out +
1 Double acting with float, kick out & flow control
| WEIGHTS |
| FrRONT |
SD_T2150 FRONT BALLAST
330182 | FRONT CARRIER 6-66LB WEIGHTS No Charge
22 |b front weight carrier + six 66 Ib weights = 396 Ibs total
REAR |
SD_T4961 REAR BALLAST
744760 | 200KG #4 RINGS 50KG 9000474P24 $608.00
2 Rear wheel weights per side
For 20" tires = Two 99 Ib weights per side = 396 Ibs total
For 24" tires = Two 110 |b weights per side = 440 Ibs total
| OPERATOR'S MANUALS |
SD_T9802 OPERATORS MANUAL
| | | 333986 | Spanish Operator's Manual, | | No Charge |
SD_T9803 FRENCH OPERATOR MANUAL
| | | XT9803X | Less French Operator Manual | | No Chargel
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