
T-628(5)
TRACTORS, AG TYPE and ATTACHMENTS
#422-1118

AGRICULTURAL TYPE TRACTORS AND ATTACHMENTS
DISCOUNT OFF LIST
SPECIFICATION 3.0

November, 2019

Vendor Name:
Contact Person:
Street Address:
P.O. Box:
City, State, Zip
Phone #:
Toll Free #:
Email Address: seth@welters.net

Spec. Number Information Requested Answer

3.1 MANUFACTURER Case IH

3.2 DATE AND ID. OF PRICE LIST PL-100 FAM Rev 9 Jan. 2,2020

3.3 CATALOG SECTION TITLE Farmall 100A Series 

3.4 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST 23%

3.5 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS  & ACCESSORIES 
 (See Special Terms and Conditions) NO BID

3.6 PRICE FOR MANUALS (1 operator's manual included at no cost, per specs)
SERVICE MANUAL

Digital $150.00
Paper $1,450.00

PARTS MANUAL 
Digital Free on Line
Paper N/A

PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS MANUAL 
Digital $100.00
Paper $250.00

3.7 PRICE FOR SET OF FLUID AND AIR FILTERS $950.00

3.8 STANDARD WARRANTY:  24 Month/2000 Hours

3.9 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS
Offer performance/warranty options.  (Add additional lines if necessary.)
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)

______________________________________________ NO BID
______________________________________________ NO BID

3.10 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR  (Hourly Shop Rate) $119.00
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions

3.11 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list 
the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate.  Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser 
that will be applied to the purchase price.  See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.

Hourly Rental Rate: NO BID
Weekly Rental Rate:  NO BID
Monthly Rental Rate:  NO BID

Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price:  NO BID

If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:  ________________

3.12 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
(See Special Terms and Conditions.)
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price NO BID

3.13 DELIVERY STARTING POINT -                                                   City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn 55313
See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed               $3.50 Per Loaded Mile

$250.00 Minimum

Buffalo,Mn<55313
763-682-2200
n/a

Trueman Welters
Seth Strehler
1600 Highway 55 east

mailto:seth@welters.net
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

Standard Equipment

 ENGINE:   OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE
 90 PTO hp @ 2200 RPM   (cont):
 273 cu. in. (4.5 L) Displacement
 4 Cylinder Turbocharged and   ROPS MODELS
 Intercooled Engine with electronic 2-Post Foldable ROPS with ISO and
 management mounted flat deck platform
 Tier 4 B/Final Emissions Compliant Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
 4 valves per cylinder Seat - Vinyl covered with mechanical
 Bosch fuel injection pump (electronic) suspension, operator's presence
 Air Cleaner w/ Precleaner Dual element sensor, retractable seat belts,
 air filter arm rests
 Hand and foot throttle Suspended pedals
 Grid Heater Starting Aid Locking brake pedals
 56.8-Gallon (215 L) Fuel Tank
 with guard   INSTRUMENTATION:
 7.9-Gallon (30L) Diesel Exhaust    Analog/Digital instrumentation cluster
 Fluid (DEF) Tank with LCD display
 Viscous fan (9 Blades)    Warning lights for air cleaner service,
 Fuel Cooler alternator, oil pressure, fuel

sediment/water sensor, headlight
 EXHAUST: high beam and parking brake
A-Post exhaust with integral muffler    Gauges for fuel level, engine

temperature, tachometer
 OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE: and hour meter.

  Digital Speedometer
 CAB MODELS
 ROPS/FOPS protected, flat deck   TRANSMISSION:
   platform    8F x 8R Synchronized Mechanical
 with heat and air conditioning, tinted     Reverser (Optional)
 windshield, retractable sun screen,    Steering column mounted Left Hand
 front wiper and washer, two doors    synchronized mechanical shuttle.
 with locks, two external mirrors, 4 (Synchronized) Gears in
 openable side windows, hinged rear 2 (Non-synchronized) Ranges
 window (fully opens) 14 in. Cerametallic Clutch
 Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt and
  telescope    8F x 8R with Power Shuttle
 Seat - Cloth covered with mechanical    Steering column mounted Left Hand
 suspension, operator's presence    Power clutchless shuttle (F/R)
 sensor, retractable seat belt, arm rests 4 (Synchronized) Gears in
 Suspended pedals 2 (Non-synchronized) Ranges
 DIN Radio, speakers and antenna Multiplate wet clutch design
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

Standard Equipment

Adjustable Tread Width from
 TRANSMISSION (cont): 64.0 in. to 80.0 in. (May vary
  16F x 8R with Power Shuttle and Hi/Lo up to 1 in. depending on tires)
   (optional)    MFD Front Axle:
  Steering column mounted Left Hand Class III MFD Axle
  Power clutchless shuttle (F/R) 55 degree Turning Angle
    Fully Synchronized Dual steering cylinders
    Two speed Hi/Lo powershift 12 degree Axle Oscillation
    Multiplate wet clutch design Electro-hydraulic MFD engagement

Limited Slip Differential
  All transmission versions: Drive Shaft Shield
    19 mph (30 kph) Adjustable tread width from
    25 mph (40 kph) (optional) 64 in. to 80 in. (May vary
    Speed varies with tire selection up to 1 in. depending on tires)

 STEERING/BRAKES:
  Hydrostatic Power Steering    Rear Axle:
  Hydraulically actuated wet disc brakes Heavy-duty Flange type
    (self-equalizing and self-adjusting) Electro-hydraulic engaged differential
  Independent Parking brake lock
    (automotive style)

  HITCH:
 HYDRAULICS:    CAB and ROPS versions:
 Fixed displacement pumps 3-point hitch category II with flex link
 Dual Gear Pumps ends and telescoping stabilizers
 Maximum Flow at Rated Engine Speed: Mechanical draft control (MDC)
 Implement Pump: 22 gpm (includes Aux (Top link sensing)
 Pump effective Oct 2017 production) Single lift rod turnbuckle adjuster
 Steering Pump: 7 gpm 7200 lb./3266 kg lift capacity (SAE)
 Total Flow: 29 gpm with a single internal and dual
(2) Close Center Deluxe Remotes (opt. external lift cylinder
for 3) with Flow Control and Category II Offset swinging drawbar
(4) Couplers

  PTO:
   Independent 540/1000 RPM with

 AUX RAMS: two individual shafts
 1 Auxiliary Lift Ram    Multi-plate wet clutch design
 5,499 pounds lift capacity    Single lever - mechanical engagement
 2 Auxiliary Lift Rams    Flip-up PTO shaft guard
 7,326 pounds lift capacity

  WHEELS & TIRES:
 AXLES:   2WD Front - 8114404
  2WD Front Axle:   2WD Rear - 8301703
    55 degree Turning Angle   4WD Front - 8201703
    Single steering cylinder   4WD Rear - 8301703
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

Standard Equipment

 ELECTRICAL:   MISCELLANEOUS:
  CAB and ROPS:    Pivoting engine hood

(1) 12-volt 950 cca / 132 amp hr    Operators manual
battery    SMV emblem

    120 Amp Alternator    Horn
    Geared starter motor (4.2kW)

7-pin outlet for trailer / implement
lighting

    Rear 3-pin implement socket (40 amp)

 LIGHTING:
  CAB
 Front: (2) Halogen Headlights and
(2) cab mounted worklights
Rear: (2) cab mounted worklights
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights
ROPS
Front: (2) Halogen Headlights
Rear: (1) Worklight,
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

Models

COMMERCIAL
MODEL

 VERSION  TRACTION Weight  Factory Data List Price

 FARMALL 110A TIER
4B/FIN

 Rops  2WD   7,000 LB   9052550P16 $67,372.00

 FARMALL 110A TIER
4B/FIN

 Rops  MFD   7,000 LB   9058157P58 $74,561.00

 FARMALL 110A TIER
4B/FIN

 Cab  2WD   7,000 LB   9061807P98 $79,241.00

 FARMALL 110A TIER
4B/FIN

 Cab  MFD   7,000 LB   9067415P40 $86,430.00

Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8771    CANOPY

CAB and ROPS

       XT8771X  Less Canopy No Charge

ROPS

       335857  Canopy    9000620P10 $795.00

          SD_T9150    REAR WIPER & WASHER

CAB

       390642  Less Rear Wiper Washer No Charge

       330642  Rear wiper/washer - CAB    9000212P16 $272.00

ROPS

       XT9150X  Std less rear wiper/washer No Charge

          SD_T9411    HIGH VISIBILITY WINDOW

CAB

       391126  Less High-visibility window No Charge

       334743  High-visibility  window    9000413P40 $530.00

ROPS

       XT9411X  No High-visibility window No Charge

     WORK LIGHTING

          SD_T9130    WORK LAMPS

       391293  1 Rear work light No Charge

CAB

       390786  4 Worklights

  2 Front and 2 Rear Worklights

No Charge
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

       336924  4 Front/4 Rear cab lights

  4 Front and 4 Rear Worklights

   9000206P70 $265.00

     TRANSPORT LIGHTS

          SD_T8708    EXTREMITY LIGHTING

       391206  Std Less Extremity Light Pkg. No Charge

       336936  Extremity light F/dual    9000234P78 $301.00

     SEAT

          SD_T5702    INSTRUCTOR SEAT

ROPS

       XT5702X  Less Instructor seat No Charge

CAB

       391127  No Instructor seat No Charge

       336937  Instructor seat    9000448P50 $575.00

          SD_T8500    SEAT

CAB and ROPS

       391268  Deluxe seat No Charge

CAB

       336923  Air suspension seat w/swivel    9000732P42 $939.00

  TRANSMISSION

     TRANSMISSION

          SD_T2800    SPEED

2WD/MFD

       391266  30 KPH 391266 No Charge

MFD Only

       337280  40 KPH    9000195P78 $251.00

          SD_T2810    TRANSMISSION

       330059  8x8 With Power Shuttle

  8x8 with Power Shuttle

  Synchro-speeds

No Charge

       330061  16x8 With Power Shuttle

  16x8 with Power Shuttle and Hi-Lo

  Synchro-speeds

   9001586P52 $2,034.00

          SD_T3230    CREEPER or Interlock

       390266  L/CREEPER FOR 8+8 No Charge

       330066  10:1 CREEPER FOR 8+8 & 16+8

  Creeper Transmission (10:1 Ratio)

  Creeper compatible with EITHER 16x8 transmission (330061) OR

  14.9R46 rear tires (8360781) but NOT with the combination.

   9001963P26 $2,517.00
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

     BACK-UP ALARM

          SD_T9249    REVERSE ALARM

       X92491X  L/Reverse Alarm No Charge

       330692  Reverse Alarm    9000131P82 $169.00

  TRAILER BRAKES

     TRAILER BRAKES

          SD_T7130    TRLR BRK VLV

       XT7130X  No hydraulic trailer brakes No Charge

  HITCH

          SD_T8950    AUX RAMS

       336784  Hyd Lift w/ 1 int. & 1 ext cyl

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 1 external lift cylinders

  (5,400 lbs/2,449 kgs lift capacity) with telescopic stabilizers.

 (900550P68) ($706.00)

       339784  Hyd Lift w/ 1 int. & 2 ext cyl

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 2 external lift cylinders

  (7,200 lbs/3,266 kgs lift capacity) with telescopic stabilizers

No Charge

     HITCH AND DRAWBAR

          SD_T8900    REAR HITCHES/DRAWBAR

       392905  Swinging Drawbar Less Clevis

  Independent swinging drawbar less clevis

No Charge

       330937  Swinging Drawbar With Clevis

  Independent swinging drawbar with clevis

   9000113P88 $146.00

     REAR 3-POINT

          SD_T8960    DRAWBAR AND 3 POINT HITCH

       390351  Cat 2 Flex Links MDC

  Cat 2 flex links for MDC (Mechanical Draft Control)

No Charge

  HYDRAULICS

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES

       429472  2 Bosch RR Flow Ctrl No Charge

       429473  3 Bosch RR Flow Ctrl    9000809P64 $1,038.00
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

  FRONT AXLE

          SD_T4010    FRONT AXLE

MFD

       XT401XX  Less 2WD Front Axle No Charge

2WD

       330403  Standard 2WD front axle No Charge

       390373  2WD Front Axle HD    9002074P80 $2,660.00

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

2WD Front

       8114404  10.00-16 8PR F2

  Firestone Brand - 2WD

No Charge

       8199101  Front Shipping Wheels-2wd

  2WD Shipping Wheels

  (NOT compatible with Heavy Duty 2WD front axle 390373)

 (900585P00) ($750.00)

       8843901  Front Shipping Wheels 2WD HD

  Requires 2WD Heavy Duty axle 390373

 (900585P00) ($750.00)

MFD Front

       8201702  13.6R24 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R30 R1W Rear Tires

 (900057P72) ($74.00)

       8201703  13.6R28 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R34 R1W Rear Tires

No Charge

       8201705  380/85R30 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R38 R1W Michelin Agribib or 520/70R38 R1W Michelin

  Omnibib Rear Tires

   9000206P70 $265.00

       8248621  250/95 R34 R1

  Requires 12.4R46 or 320/90R46 R1 Rear Tires

   9000465P66 $597.00

       8201708  13.6R38

  Requires 320/90R54 R1W – Bar Single Rear Tires

   9000886P08 $1,136.00

       8299905  Front Shipping Wheels-4WD

  4WD Shipping Wheels

 (901293P24)           ($1,658.00)

  REAR AXLE

          SD_T3200    REAR AXLE

       330331  98 in. bar axle (Steel Wheels)    9001290P12 $1,654.00

       390331  Heavy-duty Flange Axle No Charge
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

Singles for Flange Axle

       8391505  19.5Lx24 10PR R4  (900402P48) ($516.00)

       8301702  18.4R30 MICHELIN  (900411P84) ($528.00)

       8301707  520/70R38 MICHELIN

  520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib

   9002820P48 $3,616.00

       8301703  18.4R34 MICHELIN No Charge

       8301705  18.4R38 MICHELIN    9000459P42 $589.00

       8380100  12.4x42 8PR R1    9000801P84 $1,028.00

       8399905  Shipping Wheels-Rear  (902229P24)           ($2,858.00)

Singles for Bar Axle

       8301708  520/85R38 MICH BAR S

  520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib

   9002903P94 $3,723.00

       8301806  320/90R54 MICHELIN

  Requires 13.6 R38 128A8/125B Front Tires

   9002038P92 $2,614.00

       8301704  18.4R34-MICH BAR S No Charge

       8301706  18.4R38 MICH BAR S    9000459P42 $589.00

       8360761  320/90R46 R-1 – Bar  Single

  Requires 250/95 R34 R1 Front Tire

   9001604P46 $2,057.00

       8399906  Rear Shipping Wheels  (902229P24)           ($2,858.00)

Duals for Bar Axle

       8301711  18.4R34-MICH BAR D    9002803P32 $3,594.00

       8301712  18.4R38-MICH BAR D    9003722P16 $4,772.00

       8318690  DUAL 12.4x42 R1 - An    9004406P22 $5,649.00

  FENDERS

     FRONT FENDERS

          SD_T8740    FRONT FENDERS

2WD

       XT8740X  Standard less front fenders No Charge

MFD

       390860  Less Front Fenders No Charge

       336940  Front Fenders-Dynamic

  Dynamic Front Fenders – includes oscillation stops

  (Axle oscillation is limited to 8 degrees)

   9000571P74 $733.00
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FARMALL® 110A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  01

  LOADER

     LOADER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T8110    LOADER BRACKETS

       390819  Less Loader Ready No Charge

       429475  Loader Ready 429475

  Complete Loader Ready includes

  TPS Subframe Set (with Grill Guard) and

  Mid Mounted Valve - 2 function mechanical

  (Includes valve, joystick, cables, & hose kit)

   9004129P32 $5,294.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

     FRONT BALLAST

          SD_T2150    FRONT BALLAST

       390215  Less Front Carrier and Weights No Charge

       334923  Carrier less front weights    9000244P14 $313.00

       334924  Carrier - 10 weights    9001359P54 $1,743.00

     REAR BALLAST

          SD_T4961    REAR BALLAST

       XT4961X  Standard less rear ballast No Charge

Flange

       330138  6 rear wheel wts

  6 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/40 kgs each

  For use with 30" tires only

   9000659P10 $845.00

       330471  6 Rear  Wheel  Weights

  6 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/40 kgs each

  Not compatible with 30" tires or 19.5L24 R4 (8391505)

   9000659P10 $845.00

       332497  12 Rear wheel weights

  12 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/ 40 kgs each

  For use with 18.4x38 (8334606 or 8328604)

   9001315P08 $1,686.00

Bar Axle

       336935  6 Rear wheel weights

  6 rear wheel weights for bar axle, 88 lbs/65 kgs each

   9000659P10 $845.00

     ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT

          SD_T1013    ALTERNATOR

       390505  120 AMP Alternator. No Charge

       743051  200 Amp alternator    9000183P30 $235.00

-T1HP   01 016 000 01-JAN-2011 of 52



FARMALL® 120A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  02

Standard Equipment

 ENGINE:   OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE
 96 PTO hp @ 2200 RPM   (cont):
 273 cu. in. (4.5 L) Displacement
 4 Cylinder Turbocharged and   ROPS MODELS
 Intercooled Engine with electronic 2-Post Foldable ROPS with ISO and
 management mounted flat deck platform
 Tier 4 B/Final Emissions Compliant Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
 4 valves per cylinder Seat - Vinyl covered with mechanical
 Bosch fuel injection pump (electronic) suspension, operator's presence
 Air Cleaner w/ Precleaner sensor, retractable seat belts,
 Dual element air filter arm rests
 Hand and foot throttle Suspended pedals
 Grid Heater Starting Aid Locking brake pedals
 56.8-Gallon (215 L) Fuel Tank
 with guard   INSTRUMENTATION:
 7.9-Gallon (30L) Diesel Exhaust    Analog/Digital instrumentation cluster
 Fluid (DEF) Tank with LCD display
 Fixed fan (9 Blades)    Warning lights for air cleaner service,
 Fuel Cooler alternator, oil pressure, fuel

sediment/water sensor, headlight
 EXHAUST: high beam and parking brake
A-Post exhaust with integral muffler    Gauges for fuel level, engine

temperature, tachometer
 OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE: and hour meter.

  Digital Speedometer
 CAB MODELS
 ROPS/FOPS protected, flat deck   TRANSMISSION:
   platform    8F x 8R Synchronized Mechanical
 with heat and air conditioning, tinted     Reverser (Optional)
 windshield, retractable sun screen,    Steering column mounted Left Hand
 front wiper and washer, two doors    synchronized mechanical shuttle.
 with locks, two external mirrors, 4 (Synchronized) Gears in
 openable side windows, hinged rear 2 (Non-synchronized) Ranges
 window (fully opens) 14 in. Cerametallic Clutch
 Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt and
  telescope    8F x 8R with Power Shuttle
 Seat - Cloth covered with mechanical    Steering column mounted Left Hand
 suspension, operator's presence    Power clutchless shuttle (F/R)
 sensor, retractable seat belt, arm rests 4 (Synchronized) Gears in
 Suspended pedals 2 (Non-synchronized) Ranges
 DIN Radio, speakers and antenna Multiplate wet clutch design
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FARMALL® 120A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  02

Standard Equipment

Adjustable Tread Width from
 TRANSMISSION (cont): 64.0 in. to 80.0 in. (May vary
  16F x 8R with Power Shuttle and Hi/Lo up to 1 in. depending on tires)
   (optional)    MFD Front Axle:
  Steering column mounted Left Hand Class III MFD Axle
  Power clutchless shuttle (F/R) 55 degree Turning Angle
    Fully Synchronized Dual steering cylinders
    Two speed Hi/Lo powershift 12 degree Axle Oscillation
    Multiplate wet clutch design Electro-hydraulic MFD engagement

Limited Slip Differential
  All transmission versions: Drive Shaft Shield
    19 mph (30 kph) Adjustable tread width from
    25 mph (40 kph) (optional) 64 in. to 80 in. (May vary
    Speed varies with tire selection up to 1 in. depending on tires)

 STEERING/BRAKES:
  Hydrostatic Power Steering    Rear Axle:
  Hydraulically actuated wet disc brakes Heavy-duty Flange type
    (self-equalizing and self-adjusting) Electro-hydraulic engaged differential
  Independent Parking brake lock
    (automotive style)

  HITCH:
 HYDRAULICS:    CAB and ROPS versions:
 Fixed displacement pumps 3-point hitch category II with flex link
 Dual Gear Pumps ends and telescoping stabilizers
 Maximum Flow at Rated Engine Speed: Mechanical draft control (MDC)
 Implement Pump: 22 gpm (includes Aux (Top link sensing)
 Pump effective Oct 2017 production) Single lift rod turnbuckle adjuster
 Steering Pump: 7 gpm 7200 lb./3266 kg lift capacity (SAE)
 Total Flow: 29 gpm with a single internal and dual
(2) Close Center Deluxe Remotes (opt. external lift cylinder
for 3) with Flow Control and Category II Offset swinging drawbar
(4) Couplers

  PTO:
   Independent 540/1000 RPM with

 AUX RAMS: two individual shafts
 1 Auxiliary Lift Ram    Multi-plate wet clutch design
 5,499 pounds lift capacity    Single lever - mechanical engagement
 2 Auxiliary Lift Rams    Flip-up PTO shaft guard
 7,326 pounds lift capacity

  WHEELS & TIRES:
 AXLES:   2WD Front - 8114404
  2WD Front Axle:   2WD Rear - 8301703
    55 degree Turning Angle   4WD Front - 8201703
    Single steering cylinder   4WD Rear - 8301703
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FARMALL® 120A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  02

Standard Equipment

 ELECTRICAL:   MISCELLANEOUS:
  CAB and ROPS:    Pivoting engine hood

(1) 12-volt 950 cca / 132 amp hr    Operators manual
battery    SMV emblem

    120 Amp Alternator    Horn
    Geared starter motor (4.2kW)

7-pin outlet for trailer / implement
lighting

    Rear 3-pin implement socket (40 amp)

 LIGHTING:
  CAB
 Front: (2) Halogen Headlights and
(2) cab mounted worklights
Rear: (2) cab mounted worklights
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights
ROPS
Front: (2) Halogen Headlights
Rear: (1) Worklight,
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights
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FARMALL® 120A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  02

Models

COMMERCIAL
MODEL

 VERSION  TRACTION Weight  Factory Data List Price

 FARMALL 120A TIER
4B/FIN

 Rops  2WD   7,000 LB   9056134P26 $71,967.00

 FARMALL 120A TIER
4B/FIN

 Rops  MFD   11,000 LB   9061741P68 $79,156.00

 FARMALL 120A TIER
4B/FIN

 Cab  2WD   11,000 LB   9065392P08 $83,836.00

 FARMALL 120A TIER
4B/FIN

 Cab  MFD   7,000 LB   9070999P50 $91,025.00

Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price
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FARMALL® 120A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  02

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8771    CANOPY

CAB and ROPS

       XT8771X  Less Canopy No Charge

ROPS

       335857  Canopy    9000620P10 $795.00

          SD_T9150    REAR WIPER & WASHER

CAB

       390642  Less Rear Wiper Washer No Charge

       330642  Rear wiper/washer - CAB    9000212P16 $272.00

ROPS

       XT9150X  Std less rear wiper/washer No Charge

          SD_T9411    HIGH VISIBILITY WINDOW

CAB

       391126  Less High-visibility window No Charge

       334743  High-visibility  window    9000413P40 $530.00

ROPS

       XT9411X  No High-visibility window No Charge

     WORK LIGHTING

          SD_T9130    WORK LAMPS

       391293  1 Rear work light No Charge

CAB

       390786  4 Worklights

  2 Front and 2 Rear Worklights

No Charge
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FARMALL® 120A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  02

       336924  4 Front/4 Rear cab lights

  4 Front and 4 Rear Worklights

   9000206P70 $265.00

     TRANSPORT LIGHTS

          SD_T8708    EXTREMITY LIGHTING

       391206  Std Less Extremity Light Pkg. No Charge

       336936  Extremity light F/dual    9000234P78 $301.00

     SEAT

          SD_T5702    INSTRUCTOR SEAT

ROPS

       XT5702X  Less Instructor seat No Charge

CAB

       391127  No Instructor seat No Charge

       336937  Instructor seat    9000448P50 $575.00

          SD_T8500    SEAT

CAB and ROPS

       391268  Deluxe seat No Charge

CAB

       336923  Air suspension seat w/swivel    9000732P42 $939.00

  TRANSMISSION

     TRANSMISSION

          SD_T2800    SPEED

2WD/MFD

       391266  30 KPH 391266 No Charge

MFD Only

       337280  40 KPH    9000195P78 $251.00

          SD_T2810    TRANSMISSION

       330059  8x8 With Power Shuttle

  8x8 with Power Shuttle

  Synchro-speeds

No Charge

       330061  16x8 With Power Shuttle

  16x8 with Power Shuttle and Hi-Lo

  Synchro-speeds

   9001586P52 $2,034.00

          SD_T3230    CREEPER or Interlock

       390266  L/CREEPER FOR 8+8 No Charge

       330066  10:1 CREEPER FOR 8+8 & 16+8

  Creeper Transmission (10:1 Ratio)

  Creeper compatible with EITHER 16x8 transmission (330061) OR

  14.9R46 rear tires (8360781) but NOT with the combination.

   9001963P26 $2,517.00
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     BACK-UP ALARM

          SD_T9249    REVERSE ALARM

       X92491X  L/Reverse Alarm No Charge

       330692  Reverse Alarm    9000131P82 $169.00

  TRAILER BRAKES

     TRAILER BRAKES

          SD_T7130    TRLR BRK VLV

       XT7130X  No hydraulic trailer brakes No Charge

  HITCH

          SD_T8950    AUX RAMS

       336784  Hyd Lift w/ 1 int. & 1 ext cyl

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 1 external lift cylinders

  (5,400 lbs/2,449 kgs lift capacity) with telescopic stabilizers.

 (900550P68) ($706.00)

       339784  Hyd Lift w/ 1 int. & 2 ext cyl

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 2 external lift cylinders

  (7,200 lbs/3,266 kgs lift capacity) with telescopic stabilizers

No Charge

     HITCH AND DRAWBAR

          SD_T8900    REAR HITCHES/DRAWBAR

       392905  Swinging Drawbar Less Clevis

  Independent swinging drawbar less clevis

No Charge

       330937  Swinging Drawbar With Clevis

  Independent swinging drawbar with clevis

   9000113P88 $146.00

     REAR 3-POINT

          SD_T8960    DRAWBAR AND 3 POINT HITCH

       390351  Cat 2 Flex Links MDC

  Cat 2 flex links for MDC (Mechanical Draft Control)

No Charge

  HYDRAULICS

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES

       429472  2 Bosch RR Flow Ctrl No Charge

       429473  3 Bosch RR Flow Ctrl    9000809P64 $1,038.00
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  FRONT AXLE

          SD_T4010    FRONT AXLE

MFD

       XT401XX  Less 2WD Front Axle No Charge

2WD

       330403  Standard 2WD front axle No Charge

       390373  2WD Front Axle HD    9002074P80 $2,660.00

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

2WD Front

       8114404  10.00-16 8PR F2

  Firestone Brand - 2WD

No Charge

       8199101  Front Shipping Wheels-2wd

  2WD Shipping Wheels

  (NOT compatible with Heavy Duty 2WD front axle 390373)

 (900585P00) ($750.00)

       8843901  Front Shipping Wheels 2WD HD

  Requires 2WD Heavy Duty axle 390373

 (900585P00) ($750.00)

MFD Front

       8201702  13.6R24 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R30 R1W Rear Tires

 (900057P72) ($74.00)

       8201703  13.6R28 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R34 R1W Rear Tires

No Charge

       8201705  380/85R30 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R38 R1W Michelin Agribib or 520/70R38 R1W Michelin

  Omnibib Rear Tires

   9000206P70 $265.00

       8248621  250/95 R34 R1

  Requires 12.4R46 or 320/90R46 R1 Rear Tires

   9000465P66 $597.00

       8201708  13.6R38

  Requires 320/90R54 R1W – Bar Single Rear Tires

   9000886P08 $1,136.00

       8299905  Front Shipping Wheels-4WD

  4WD Shipping Wheels

 (901293P24)           ($1,658.00)

  REAR AXLE

          SD_T3200    REAR AXLE

       330331  98 in. bar axle (Steel Wheels)    9001290P12 $1,654.00

       390331  Heavy-duty Flange Axle No Charge
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  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

Singles for Flange Axle

       8391505  19.5Lx24 10PR R4  (900402P48) ($516.00)

       8301702  18.4R30 MICHELIN  (900411P84) ($528.00)

       8301707  520/70R38 MICHELIN

  520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib

   9002820P48 $3,616.00

       8301703  18.4R34 MICHELIN No Charge

       8301705  18.4R38 MICHELIN    9000459P42 $589.00

       8380100  12.4x42 8PR R1    9000801P84 $1,028.00

       8399905  Shipping Wheels-Rear  (902229P24)           ($2,858.00)

Singles for Bar Axle

       8301708  520/85R38 MICH BAR S

  520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib

   9002903P94 $3,723.00

       8301806  320/90R54 MICHELIN

  Requires 13.6 R38 128A8/125B Front Tires

   9002038P92 $2,614.00

       8301704  18.4R34-MICH BAR S No Charge

       8301706  18.4R38 MICH BAR S    9000459P42 $589.00

       8360761  320/90R46 R-1 – Bar  Single

  Requires 250/95 R34 R1 Front Tire

   9001604P46 $2,057.00

       8399906  Rear Shipping Wheels  (902229P24)           ($2,858.00)

Duals for Bar Axle

       8301711  18.4R34-MICH BAR D    9002803P32 $3,594.00

       8301712  18.4R38-MICH BAR D    9003722P16 $4,772.00

       8318690  DUAL 12.4x42 R1 - An    9004406P22 $5,649.00

  FENDERS

     FRONT FENDERS

          SD_T8740    FRONT FENDERS

2WD

       XT8740X  Standard less front fenders No Charge

MFD

       390860  Less Front Fenders No Charge

       336940  Front Fenders-Dynamic

  Dynamic Front Fenders – includes oscillation stops

  (Axle oscillation is limited to 8 degrees)

   9000571P74 $733.00
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  LOADER

     LOADER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T8110    LOADER BRACKETS

       390819  Less Loader Ready No Charge

       429475  Loader Ready 429475

  Complete Loader Ready includes

  TPS Subframe Set (with Grill Guard) and

  Mid Mounted Valve - 2 function mechanical

  (Includes valve, joystick, cables, & hose kit)

   9004129P32 $5,294.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

     FRONT BALLAST

          SD_T2150    FRONT BALLAST

       390215  Less Front Carrier and Weights No Charge

       334923  Carrier less front weights    9000244P14 $313.00

       334924  Carrier - 10 weights    9001359P54 $1,743.00

     REAR BALLAST

          SD_T4961    REAR BALLAST

       XT4961X  Standard less rear ballast No Charge

Flange

       330138  6 rear wheel wts

  6 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/40 kgs each

  For use with 30" tires only

   9000659P10 $845.00

       330471  6 Rear  Wheel  Weights

  6 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/40 kgs each

  Not compatible with 30" tires or 19.5L24 R4 (8391505)

   9000659P10 $845.00

       332497  12 Rear wheel weights

  12 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/ 40 kgs each

  For use with 18.4x38 (8334606 or 8328604)

   9001315P08 $1,686.00

Bar Axle

       336935  6 Rear wheel weights

  6 rear wheel weights for bar axle, 88 lbs/65 kgs each

   9000659P10 $845.00

     ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT

          SD_T1013    ALTERNATOR

       390505  120 AMP Alternator. No Charge

       743051  200 Amp alternator    9000183P30 $235.00
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Standard Equipment

 ENGINE:   OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE
 108 PTO hp @ 2200 RPM   (cont):
 273 cu. in. (4.5 L) Displacement
 4 Cylinder Turbocharged and   ROPS MODELS
 Intercooled Engine with electronic 2-Post Foldable ROPS with ISO and
 management mounted flat deck platform
 Tier 4 B/Final Emissions Compliant Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
 4 valves per cylinder Seat - Vinyl covered with mechanical
 Bosch fuel injection pump (electronic) suspension, operator's presence
 Air Cleaner w/ Precleaner Dual element sensor, retractable seat belts,
 air filter arm rests
 Hand and foot throttle Suspended pedals
 Grid Heater Starting Aid Locking brake pedals
 56.8-Gallon (215 L) Fuel Tank
 with guard   INSTRUMENTATION:
 7.9-Gallon (30L) Diesel Exhaust    Analog/Digital instrumentation cluster
 Fluid (DEF) Tank with LCD display
 Fixed fan (9 Blades)    Warning lights for air cleaner service,
 Fuel Cooler alternator, oil pressure, fuel

sediment/water sensor, headlight
 EXHAUST: high beam and parking brake
A-Post exhaust with integral muffler    Gauges for fuel level, engine

temperature, tachometer
 OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE: and hour meter.

  Digital Speedometer
 CAB MODELS
 ROPS/FOPS protected, flat deck   TRANSMISSION:
   platform    8F x 8R Synchronized Mechanical
 with heat and air conditioning, tinted     Reverser (Optional)
 windshield, retractable sun screen,    Steering column mounted Left Hand
 front wiper and washer, two doors    synchronized mechanical shuttle.
 with locks, two external mirrors, 4 (Synchronized) Gears in
 openable side windows, hinged rear 2 (Non-synchronized) Ranges
 window (fully opens) 14 in. Cerametallic Clutch
 Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt and
  telescope    8F x 8R with Power Shuttle
 Seat - Cloth covered with mechanical    Steering column mounted Left Hand
 suspension, operator's presence    Power clutchless shuttle (F/R)
 sensor, retractable seat belt, arm rests 4 (Synchronized) Gears in
 Suspended pedals 2 (Non-synchronized) Ranges
 DIN Radio, speakers and antenna Multiplate wet clutch design
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Standard Equipment

Adjustable Tread Width from
 TRANSMISSION (cont): 64.0 in. to 80.0 in. (May vary
  16F x 8R with Power Shuttle and Hi/Lo up to 1 in. depending on tires)
   (optional)    MFD Front Axle:
  Steering column mounted Left Hand Class III MFD Axle
  Power clutchless shuttle (F/R) 55 degree Turning Angle
    Fully Synchronized Dual steering cylinders
    Two speed Hi/Lo powershift 12 degree Axle Oscillation
    Multiplate wet clutch design Electro-hydraulic MFD engagement

Limited Slip Differential
  All transmission versions: Drive Shaft Shield
    19 mph (30 kph) Adjustable tread width from
    25 mph (40 kph) (optional) 64 in. to 80 in. (May vary
    Speed varies with tire selection up to 1 in. depending on tires)

 STEERING/BRAKES:
  Hydrostatic Power Steering    Rear Axle:
  Hydraulically actuated wet disc brakes Heavy-duty Flange type
    (self-equalizing and self-adjusting) Electro-hydraulic engaged differential
  Independent Parking brake lock
    (automotive style)

  HITCH:
 HYDRAULICS:    CAB and ROPS versions:
 Fixed displacement pumps 3-point hitch category II with flex link
 Dual Gear Pumps ends and telescoping stabilizers
 Maximum Flow at Rated Engine Speed: Mechanical draft control (MDC)
 Implement Pump: 22 gpm (includes Aux (Top link sensing)
 Pump effective Oct 2017 production) Single lift rod turnbuckle adjuster
 Steering Pump: 7 gpm 7200 lb./3266 kg lift capacity (SAE)
 Total Flow: 29 gpm with a single internal and dual
(2) Close Center Deluxe Remotes (opt. external lift cylinder
for 3) with Flow Control and Category II Offset swinging drawbar
(4) Couplers

  PTO:
   Independent 540/1000 RPM with

 AUX RAMS: two individual shafts
 1 Auxiliary Lift Ram    Multi-plate wet clutch design
 5,499 pounds lift capacity    Single lever - mechanical engagement
 2 Auxiliary Lift Rams    Flip-up PTO shaft guard
 7,326 pounds lift capacity

  WHEELS & TIRES:
 AXLES:   2WD Front - 8180522
  2WD Front Axle:   2WD Rear - 8301703
    55 degree Turning Angle   4WD Front - 8201703
    Single steering cylinder   4WD Rear - 8301703
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Standard Equipment

 ELECTRICAL:   MISCELLANEOUS:
  CAB and ROPS:    Pivoting engine hood

(1) 12-volt 950 cca / 132 amp hr    Operators manual
battery    SMV emblem

    120 Amp Alternator    Horn
    Geared starter motor (4.2kW)

7-pin outlet for trailer / implement
lighting

    Rear 3-pin implement socket (40 amp)

 LIGHTING:
  CAB
 Front: (2) Halogen Headlights and
(2) cab mounted worklights
Rear: (2) cab mounted worklights
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights
ROPS
Front: (2) Halogen Headlights
Rear: (1) Worklight,
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights
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Models

COMMERCIAL
MODEL

 VERSION  TRACTION Weight  Factory Data List Price

 FARMALL 130A TIER
4B/FIN

 Rops  2WD   7,000 LB   9060153P60 $77,120.00

 FARMALL 130A TIER
4B/FIN

 Rops  MFD   7,000 LB   9065761P02 $84,309.00

 FARMALL 130A TIER
4B/FIN

 Cab  2WD   7,000 LB   9069411P42 $88,989.00

 FARMALL 130A TIER
4B/FIN

 Cab  MFD   7,000 LB   9075018P84 $96,178.00

Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price
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  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8771    CANOPY

CAB and ROPS

       XT8771X  Less Canopy No Charge

ROPS

       335857  Canopy    9000620P10 $795.00

          SD_T9150    REAR WIPER & WASHER

CAB

       390642  Less Rear Wiper Washer No Charge

       330642  Rear wiper/washer - CAB    9000212P16 $272.00

ROPS

       XT9150X  Std less rear wiper/washer No Charge

          SD_T9411    HIGH VISIBILITY WINDOW

CAB

       391126  Less High-visibility window No Charge

       334743  High-visibility  window    9000413P40 $530.00

ROPS

       XT9411X  No High-visibility window No Charge

     WORK LIGHTING

          SD_T9130    WORK LAMPS

       391293  1 Rear work light No Charge

CAB

       390786  4 Worklights

  2 Front and 2 Rear Worklights

No Charge
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       336924  4 Front/4 Rear cab lights

  4 Front and 4 Rear Worklights

   9000206P70 $265.00

     TRANSPORT LIGHTS

          SD_T8708    EXTREMITY LIGHTING

       391206  Std Less Extremity Light Pkg. No Charge

       336936  Extremity light F/dual    9000234P78 $301.00

     SEAT

          SD_T5702    INSTRUCTOR SEAT

ROPS

       XT5702X  Less Instructor seat No Charge

CAB

       391127  No Instructor seat No Charge

       336937  Instructor seat    9000448P50 $575.00

          SD_T8500    SEAT

CAB and ROPS

       391268  Deluxe seat No Charge

CAB

       336923  Air suspension seat w/swivel    9000732P42 $939.00

  TRANSMISSION

     TRANSMISSION

          SD_T2800    SPEED

2WD/MFD

       391266  30 KPH 391266 No Charge

MFD Only

       337280  40 KPH    9000195P78 $251.00

          SD_T2810    TRANSMISSION

       330059  8x8 With Power Shuttle

  8x8 with Power Shuttle

  Synchro-speeds

No Charge

       330061  16x8 With Power Shuttle

  16x8 with Power Shuttle and Hi-Lo

  Synchro-speeds

   9001586P52 $2,034.00

          SD_T3230    CREEPER or Interlock

       390266  L/CREEPER FOR 8+8 No Charge

       330066  10:1 CREEPER FOR 8+8 & 16+8

  Creeper Transmission (10:1 Ratio)

  Creeper compatible with EITHER 16x8 transmission (330061) OR

  14.9R46 rear tires (8360781) but NOT with the combination.

   9001963P26 $2,517.00
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     BACK-UP ALARM

          SD_T9249    REVERSE ALARM

       X92491X  L/Reverse Alarm No Charge

       330692  Reverse Alarm    9000131P82 $169.00

  TRAILER BRAKES

     TRAILER BRAKES

          SD_T7130    TRLR BRK VLV

       XT7130X  No hydraulic trailer brakes No Charge

  HITCH

          SD_T8950    AUX RAMS

       336784  Hyd Lift w/ 1 int. & 1 ext cyl

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 1 external lift cylinders

  (5,400 lbs/2,449 kgs lift capacity) with telescopic stabilizers.

 (900550P68) ($706.00)

       339784  Hyd Lift w/ 1 int. & 2 ext cyl

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 2 external lift cylinders

  (7,200 lbs/3,266 kgs lift capacity) with telescopic stabilizers

No Charge

     HITCH AND DRAWBAR

          SD_T8900    REAR HITCHES/DRAWBAR

       392905  Swinging Drawbar Less Clevis

  Independent swinging drawbar less clevis

No Charge

       330937  Swinging Drawbar With Clevis

  Independent swinging drawbar with clevis

   9000113P88 $146.00

     REAR 3-POINT

          SD_T8960    DRAWBAR AND 3 POINT HITCH

       390351  Cat 2 Flex Links MDC

  Cat 2 flex links for MDC (Mechanical Draft Control)

No Charge

  HYDRAULICS

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES

       429472  2 Bosch RR Flow Ctrl No Charge

       429473  3 Bosch RR Flow Ctrl    9000809P64 $1,038.00
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  FRONT AXLE

          SD_T4010    FRONT AXLE

MFD

       XT401XX  Less 2WD Front Axle No Charge

2WD

       390373  2WD Front Axle HD No Charge

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

2WD Front

       8843901  Front Shipping Wheels 2WD HD

  Requires 2WD Heavy Duty axle 390373

 (900585P00) ($750.00)

MFD Front

       8201702  13.6R24 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R30 R1W Rear Tires

 (900057P72) ($74.00)

       8201703  13.6R28 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R34 R1W Rear Tires

No Charge

       8201705  380/85R30 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R38 R1W Michelin Agribib or 520/70R38 R1W Michelin

  Omnibib Rear Tires

   9000206P70 $265.00

       8248621  250/95 R34 R1

  Requires 12.4R46 or 320/90R46 R1 Rear Tires

   9000465P66 $597.00

       8201708  13.6R38

  Requires 320/90R54 R1W – Bar Single Rear Tires

   9000886P08 $1,136.00

       8299905  Front Shipping Wheels-4WD

  4WD Shipping Wheels

 (901293P24)           ($1,658.00)

  REAR AXLE

          SD_T3200    REAR AXLE

       330331  98 in. bar axle (Steel Wheels)    9001290P12 $1,654.00

       390331  Heavy-duty Flange Axle No Charge

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

Singles for Flange Axle

       8391505  19.5Lx24 10PR R4  (900402P48) ($516.00)

       8301702  18.4R30 MICHELIN  (900411P84) ($528.00)
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       8301707  520/70R38 MICHELIN

  520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib

   9002820P48 $3,616.00

       8301703  18.4R34 MICHELIN No Charge

       8301705  18.4R38 MICHELIN    9000459P42 $589.00

       8380100  12.4x42 8PR R1    9000801P84 $1,028.00

       8399905  Shipping Wheels-Rear  (902229P24)           ($2,858.00)

Singles for Bar Axle

       8301708  520/85R38 MICH BAR S

  520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib

   9002903P94 $3,723.00

       8301806  320/90R54 MICHELIN

  Requires 13.6 R38 128A8/125B Front Tires

   9002038P92 $2,614.00

       8301704  18.4R34-MICH BAR S No Charge

       8301706  18.4R38 MICH BAR S    9000459P42 $589.00

       8360761  320/90R46 R-1 – Bar  Single

  Requires 250/95 R34 R1 Front Tire

   9001604P46 $2,057.00

       8399906  Rear Shipping Wheels  (902229P24)           ($2,858.00)

Duals for Bar Axle

       8301711  18.4R34-MICH BAR D    9002803P32 $3,594.00

       8301712  18.4R38-MICH BAR D    9003722P16 $4,772.00

       8318690  DUAL 12.4x42 R1 - An    9004406P22 $5,649.00

  FENDERS

     FRONT FENDERS

          SD_T8740    FRONT FENDERS

2WD

       XT8740X  Standard less front fenders No Charge

MFD

       390860  Less Front Fenders No Charge

       337496  PARALAMA FRONTAL LARGURA 480MM

  Fixed Front Fenders – for 130A/140A only

  (Not compatible with Complete Loader Ready)

   9000373P62 $479.00

       336940  Front Fenders-Dynamic

  Dynamic Front Fenders – includes oscillation stops

  (Axle oscillation is limited to 8 degrees)

   9000571P74 $733.00

  LOADER

     LOADER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T8110    LOADER BRACKETS

       390819  Less Loader Ready No Charge
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       429475  Loader Ready 429475

  Complete Loader Ready includes

  TPS Subframe Set (with Grill Guard) and

  Mid Mounted Valve - 2 function mechanical

  (Includes valve, joystick, cables, & hose kit)

   9004129P32 $5,294.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

     FRONT BALLAST

          SD_T2150    FRONT BALLAST

       390215  Less Front Carrier and Weights No Charge

       334923  Carrier less front weights    9000244P14 $313.00

       334924  Carrier - 10 weights    9001359P54 $1,743.00

     REAR BALLAST

          SD_T4961    REAR BALLAST

       XT4961X  Standard less rear ballast No Charge

Flange

       330138  6 rear wheel wts

  6 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/40 kgs each

  For use with 30" tires only

   9000659P10 $845.00

       330471  6 Rear  Wheel  Weights

  6 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/40 kgs each

  Not compatible with 30" tires or 19.5L24 R4 (8391505)

   9000659P10 $845.00

       332497  12 Rear wheel weights

  12 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/ 40 kgs each

  For use with 18.4x38 (8334606 or 8328604)

   9001315P08 $1,686.00

Bar Axle

       336935  6 Rear wheel weights

  6 rear wheel weights for bar axle, 88 lbs/65 kgs each

   9000659P10 $845.00

     ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT

          SD_T1013    ALTERNATOR

       390505  120 AMP Alternator. No Charge

       743051  200 Amp alternator    9000183P30 $235.00
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Standard Equipment

 ENGINE:   OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE
 115 PTO hp @ 2200 RPM   (cont):
 273 cu. in. (4.5 L) Displacement
 4 Cylinder Turbocharged and   ROPS MODELS
 Intercooled Engine with electronic 2-Post Foldable ROPS with ISO and
 management mounted flat deck platform
 Tier 4 B/Final Emissions Compliant Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
 4 valves per cylinder Seat - Vinyl covered with mechanical
 Bosch fuel injection pump (electronic) suspension, operator's presence
 Air Cleaner w/ Precleaner Dual element sensor, retractable seat belts,
 air filter arm rests
 Hand and foot throttle Suspended pedals
 Grid Heater Starting Aid Locking brake pedals
 56.8-Gallon (215 L) Fuel Tank
 with guard   INSTRUMENTATION:
 7.9-Gallon (30L) Diesel Exhaust    Analog/Digital instrumentation cluster
 Fluid (DEF) Tank with LCD display
 Fixed fan (9 Blades)    Warning lights for air cleaner service,
 Fuel Cooler alternator, oil pressure, fuel

sediment/water sensor, headlight
 EXHAUST: high beam and parking brake
A-Post exhaust with integral muffler    Gauges for fuel level, engine

temperature, tachometer
 OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE: and hour meter.

  Digital Speedometer
 CAB MODELS
 ROPS/FOPS protected, flat deck   TRANSMISSION:
   platform    8F x 8R Synchronized Mechanical
 with heat and air conditioning, tinted     Reverser (Optional)
 windshield, retractable sun screen,    Steering column mounted Left Hand
 front wiper and washer, two doors    synchronized mechanical shuttle.
 with locks, two external mirrors, 4 (Synchronized) Gears in
 openable side windows, hinged rear 2 (Non-synchronized) Ranges
 window (fully opens) 14 in. Cerametallic Clutch
 Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt and
  telescope    8F x 8R with Power Shuttle
 Seat - Cloth covered with mechanical    Steering column mounted Left Hand
 suspension, operator's presence    Power clutchless shuttle (F/R)
 sensor, retractable seat belt, arm rests 4 (Synchronized) Gears in
 Suspended pedals 2 (Non-synchronized) Ranges
 DIN Radio, speakers and antenna Multiplate wet clutch design
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FARMALL® 140A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
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-T1HP  04

Standard Equipment

Adjustable Tread Width from
 TRANSMISSION (cont): 64.0 in. to 80.0 in. (May vary
  16F x 8R with Power Shuttle and Hi/Lo up to 1 in. depending on tires)
   (optional)    MFD Front Axle:
  Steering column mounted Left Hand Class III MFD Axle
  Power clutchless shuttle (F/R) 55 degree Turning Angle
    Fully Synchronized Dual steering cylinders
    Two speed Hi/Lo powershift 12 degree Axle Oscillation
    Multiplate wet clutch design Electro-hydraulic MFD engagement

Limited Slip Differential
  All transmission versions: Drive Shaft Shield
    19 mph (30 kph) Adjustable tread width from
    25 mph (40 kph) (optional) 64 in. to 80 in. (May vary
    Speed varies with tire selection up to 1 in. depending on tires)

 STEERING/BRAKES:
  Hydrostatic Power Steering    Rear Axle:
  Hydraulically actuated wet disc brakes Heavy-duty Flange type
    (self-equalizing and self-adjusting) Electro-hydraulic engaged differential
  Independent Parking brake lock
    (automotive style)

  HITCH:
 HYDRAULICS:    CAB and ROPS versions:
 Fixed displacement pumps 3-point hitch category II with flex link
 Dual Gear Pumps ends and telescoping stabilizers
 Maximum Flow at Rated Engine Speed: Mechanical draft control (MDC)
 Implement Pump: 22 gpm (includes Aux (Top link sensing)
 Pump effective Oct 2017 production) Single lift rod turnbuckle adjuster
 Steering Pump: 7 gpm 7200 lb./3266 kg lift capacity (SAE)
 Total Flow: 29 gpm with a single internal and dual
(2) Close Center Deluxe Remotes (opt. external lift cylinder
for 3) with Flow Control and Category II Offset swinging drawbar
(4) Couplers

  PTO:
   Independent 540/1000 RPM with

 AUX RAMS: two individual shafts
 1 Auxiliary Lift Ram    Multi-plate wet clutch design
 5,499 pounds lift capacity    Single lever - mechanical engagement
 2 Auxiliary Lift Rams    Flip-up PTO shaft guard
 7,326 pounds lift capacity

  WHEELS & TIRES:
 AXLES:   2WD Front - 8180522
  2WD Front Axle:   2WD Rear - 8301703
    55 degree Turning Angle   4WD Front - 8201703
    Single steering cylinder   4WD Rear - 8301703
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Standard Equipment

 ELECTRICAL:   MISCELLANEOUS:
  CAB and ROPS:    Pivoting engine hood

(1) 12-volt 950 cca / 132 amp hr    Operators manual
battery    SMV emblem

    120 Amp Alternator    Horn
    Geared starter motor (4.2kW)

7-pin outlet for trailer / implement
lighting

    Rear 3-pin implement socket (40 amp)

 LIGHTING:
  CAB
 Front: (2) Halogen Headlights and
(2) cab mounted worklights
Rear: (2) cab mounted worklights
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights
ROPS
Front: (2) Halogen Headlights
Rear: (1) Worklight,
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights
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Models

COMMERCIAL
MODEL

 VERSION  TRACTION Weight  Factory Data List Price

 FARMALL 140A TIER
4B/FIN

 Rops  2WD   7,000 LB   9066049P62 $84,679.00

 FARMALL 140A TIER
4B/FIN

 Rops  MFD   7,000 LB   9071657P04 $91,868.00

 FARMALL 140A TIER
4B/FIN

 Cab  2WD   7,000 LB   9075307P44 $96,548.00

 FARMALL 140A TIER
4B/FIN

 Cab  MFD   12,000 LB   9080914P86            $103,737.00

Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price

  PACKAGES
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FARMALL® 140A TRACTOR TIER 4B/FINAL
US PRICE LIST

-T1HP  04

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8771    CANOPY

CAB and ROPS

       XT8771X  Less Canopy No Charge

ROPS

       335857  Canopy    9000620P10 $795.00

          SD_T9150    REAR WIPER & WASHER

CAB

       390642  Less Rear Wiper Washer No Charge

       330642  Rear wiper/washer - CAB    9000212P16 $272.00

ROPS

       XT9150X  Std less rear wiper/washer No Charge

          SD_T9411    HIGH VISIBILITY WINDOW

CAB

       391126  Less High-visibility window No Charge

       334743  High-visibility  window    9000413P40 $530.00

ROPS

       XT9411X  No High-visibility window No Charge

     WORK LIGHTING

          SD_T9130    WORK LAMPS

       391293  1 Rear work light No Charge

CAB

       390786  4 Worklights

  2 Front and 2 Rear Worklights

No Charge
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-T1HP  04

       336924  4 Front/4 Rear cab lights

  4 Front and 4 Rear Worklights

   9000206P70 $265.00

     TRANSPORT LIGHTS

          SD_T8708    EXTREMITY LIGHTING

       391206  Std Less Extremity Light Pkg. No Charge

       336936  Extremity light F/dual    9000234P78 $301.00

     SEAT

          SD_T5702    INSTRUCTOR SEAT

ROPS

       XT5702X  Less Instructor seat No Charge

CAB

       391127  No Instructor seat No Charge

       336937  Instructor seat    9000448P50 $575.00

          SD_T8500    SEAT

CAB and ROPS

       391268  Deluxe seat No Charge

CAB

       336923  Air suspension seat w/swivel    9000732P42 $939.00

  TRANSMISSION

     TRANSMISSION

          SD_T2800    SPEED

2WD/MFD

       391266  30 KPH 391266 No Charge

MFD Only

       337280  40 KPH    9000195P78 $251.00

          SD_T2810    TRANSMISSION

       330059  8x8 With Power Shuttle

  8x8 with Power Shuttle

  Synchro-speeds

No Charge

       330061  16x8 With Power Shuttle

  16x8 with Power Shuttle and Hi-Lo

  Synchro-speeds

   9001586P52 $2,034.00

          SD_T3230    CREEPER or Interlock

       390266  L/CREEPER FOR 8+8 No Charge

       330066  10:1 CREEPER FOR 8+8 & 16+8

  Creeper Transmission (10:1 Ratio)

  Creeper compatible with EITHER 16x8 transmission (330061) OR

  14.9R46 rear tires (8360781) but NOT with the combination.

   9001963P26 $2,517.00
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     BACK-UP ALARM

          SD_T9249    REVERSE ALARM

       X92491X  L/Reverse Alarm No Charge

       330692  Reverse Alarm    9000131P82 $169.00

  TRAILER BRAKES

     TRAILER BRAKES

          SD_T7130    TRLR BRK VLV

       XT7130X  No hydraulic trailer brakes No Charge

  HITCH

          SD_T8950    AUX RAMS

       336784  Hyd Lift w/ 1 int. & 1 ext cyl

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 1 external lift cylinders

  (5,400 lbs/2,449 kgs lift capacity) with telescopic stabilizers.

 (900550P68) ($706.00)

       339784  Hyd Lift w/ 1 int. & 2 ext cyl

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 2 external lift cylinders

  (7,200 lbs/3,266 kgs lift capacity) with telescopic stabilizers

No Charge

     HITCH AND DRAWBAR

          SD_T8900    REAR HITCHES/DRAWBAR

       392905  Swinging Drawbar Less Clevis

  Independent swinging drawbar less clevis

No Charge

       330937  Swinging Drawbar With Clevis

  Independent swinging drawbar with clevis

   9000113P88 $146.00

     REAR 3-POINT

          SD_T8960    DRAWBAR AND 3 POINT HITCH

       390351  Cat 2 Flex Links MDC

  Cat 2 flex links for MDC (Mechanical Draft Control)

No Charge

  HYDRAULICS

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES

       429472  2 Bosch RR Flow Ctrl No Charge

       429473  3 Bosch RR Flow Ctrl    9000809P64 $1,038.00
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  FRONT AXLE

          SD_T4010    FRONT AXLE

MFD

       XT401XX  Less 2WD Front Axle No Charge

2WD

       390373  2WD Front Axle HD No Charge

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

2WD Front

       8843901  Front Shipping Wheels 2WD HD

  Requires 2WD Heavy Duty axle 390373

 (900585P00) ($750.00)

MFD Front

       8201702  13.6R24 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R30 R1W Rear Tires

 (900057P72) ($74.00)

       8201703  13.6R28 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R34 R1W Rear Tires

No Charge

       8201705  380/85R30 MICHELIN

  Requires 18.4R38 R1W Michelin Agribib or 520/70R38 R1W Michelin

  Omnibib Rear Tires

   9000206P70 $265.00

       8248621  250/95 R34 R1

  Requires 12.4R46 or 320/90R46 R1 Rear Tires

   9000465P66 $597.00

       8201708  13.6R38

  Requires 320/90R54 R1W – Bar Single Rear Tires

   9000886P08 $1,136.00

       8299905  Front Shipping Wheels-4WD

  4WD Shipping Wheels

 (901293P24)           ($1,658.00)

  REAR AXLE

          SD_T3200    REAR AXLE

       330331  98 in. bar axle (Steel Wheels)    9001290P12 $1,654.00

       390331  Heavy-duty Flange Axle No Charge

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

Singles for Flange Axle

       8391505  19.5Lx24 10PR R4  (900402P48) ($516.00)

       8301702  18.4R30 MICHELIN  (900411P84) ($528.00)
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       8301707  520/70R38 MICHELIN

  520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib

   9002820P48 $3,616.00

       8301703  18.4R34 MICHELIN No Charge

       8301705  18.4R38 MICHELIN    9000459P42 $589.00

       8380100  12.4x42 8PR R1    9000801P84 $1,028.00

       8399905  Shipping Wheels-Rear  (902229P24)           ($2,858.00)

Singles for Bar Axle

       8301708  520/85R38 MICH BAR S

  520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib

   9002903P94 $3,723.00

       8301806  320/90R54 MICHELIN

  Requires 13.6 R38 128A8/125B Front Tires

   9002038P92 $2,614.00

       8301704  18.4R34-MICH BAR S No Charge

       8301706  18.4R38 MICH BAR S    9000459P42 $589.00

       8360761  320/90R46 R-1 – Bar  Single

  Requires 250/95 R34 R1 Front Tire

   9001604P46 $2,057.00

       8399906  Rear Shipping Wheels  (902229P24)           ($2,858.00)

Duals for Bar Axle

       8301711  18.4R34-MICH BAR D    9002803P32 $3,594.00

       8301712  18.4R38-MICH BAR D    9003722P16 $4,772.00

       8318690  DUAL 12.4x42 R1 - An    9004406P22 $5,649.00

  FENDERS

     FRONT FENDERS

          SD_T8740    FRONT FENDERS

2WD

       XT8740X  Standard less front fenders No Charge

MFD

       390860  Less Front Fenders No Charge

       337496  PARALAMA FRONTAL LARGURA 480MM

  Fixed Front Fenders – for 130A/140A only

  (Not compatible with Complete Loader Ready)

   9000373P62 $479.00

       336940  Front Fenders-Dynamic

  Dynamic Front Fenders – includes oscillation stops

  (Axle oscillation is limited to 8 degrees)

   9000571P74 $733.00

  LOADER

     LOADER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T8110    LOADER BRACKETS

       390819  Less Loader Ready No Charge
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       429475  Loader Ready 429475

  Complete Loader Ready includes

  TPS Subframe Set (with Grill Guard) and

  Mid Mounted Valve - 2 function mechanical

  (Includes valve, joystick, cables, & hose kit)

   9004129P32 $5,294.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

     FRONT BALLAST

          SD_T2150    FRONT BALLAST

       390215  Less Front Carrier and Weights No Charge

       334923  Carrier less front weights    9000244P14 $313.00

       334924  Carrier - 10 weights    9001359P54 $1,743.00

     REAR BALLAST

          SD_T4961    REAR BALLAST

       XT4961X  Standard less rear ballast No Charge

Flange

       330138  6 rear wheel wts

  6 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/40 kgs each

  For use with 30" tires only

   9000659P10 $845.00

       330471  6 Rear  Wheel  Weights

  6 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/40 kgs each

  Not compatible with 30" tires or 19.5L24 R4 (8391505)

   9000659P10 $845.00

       332497  12 Rear wheel weights

  12 rear wheel weights for flange axle, 88 lbs/ 40 kgs each

  For use with 18.4x38 (8334606 or 8328604)

   9001315P08 $1,686.00

Bar Axle

       336935  6 Rear wheel weights

  6 rear wheel weights for bar axle, 88 lbs/65 kgs each

   9000659P10 $845.00
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Tire Combinations - 110A, 120A, 130A, 140A

Type 12.5/80-18 R4 13.6R24 R1W 13.6R28 R1W 14.9R28 R1W 380/85R30 R1W 12.4x28 R1 250/95R34 R1 320/85R34 R1 FR Shipping Whl
Type Variant 8244641 8201702 8201703 8201704 8201705 8282201 8248621 8248631 8299905 8114404 8180522 8199101 8843901
REAR Wheels for Flange Axle Std. Duty F. Axle HD Front Axle Std. Duty F. Axle HD Front Axle
19.5Lx24 10 ply R4 8391505 X X X X X
18.4R30 R1W Michelin Agribib 8301702 X X X X X
18.4R34 R1W Michelin Agribib 8301703 X X X X X
18.4R38 R1W Michelin Agribib 8301705 110/120 130/140 X X X X
520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib 8301707 110/120 130/140 X X X X
12.4x42 R1 Firestone 8380100 X X X X X
RR Shipping Wheels 8399905 X X X X X

REAR SINGLE Wheels for 98" Bar Axle
18.4R34 R1W Michelin Agribib 8301704 X X X X X
18.4R38 R1W Michelin Agribib 8301706 110/120 130/140 X X X X
520/70R38 R1W Michelin Omnibib 8301708 110/120 130/140 X X X X
12.4x42 R1 Firestone 8318590 X X X X X
320/90R46 R1 Goodyear * 8360761 X X X X X
380/85R46 R1 Goodyear * 8360781 X X X X X
RR Shipping Wheels 8399906 X X X X X

REAR DUAL Wheels for 98" Bar Axle
18.4R34 R1W Michelin Agribib 8301711 X X X X X
18.4R38 R1W Michelin Agribib 8301712 110/120 130/140 X X X X
12.4x42 R1 Firestone 8318690 X X X X X

Farmall 100A Tier 4B  Tire Charts

FRONT Wheels for 4WD FRONT AXLE

Front Ship Whl10.00x16 8ply (F2) Firestone

FRONT Wheels for 2WD FRONT AXLE
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